
View this email in your browser

Designing Buildings Wiki
The construction industry knowledge base
 

Featured articles and news

Chernobyl New Safe Confinement

The story behind the world's largest land-based moving structure.

London Design Museum

The unveiling of the new
Design Museum in
Kensington.

Unusual building of the
week

Santiago Calatrava's one-of-
a-kind 'crashing wave' arch.

Redfern review

Review suggests high
property prices are the result
of high income, high
employment and low interest
rates rather than a lack of
supply.

WiredScore

Certification of building
connectivity and digital
infrastructure.

Mayan pyramid discovery

Experts discover a third
smaller structure within the
'Russian doll' pyramid El
Castillo.

Variations in construction contracts

Almost all construction projects vary from the original scope of
works. So how are variations controlled and valued?

Around the web

RICS, 22 Nov

Consultation launched for
International Construction
Measurement Standards
(ICMS).

Construction Manager, 22
Nov

Andrew Wolstenholme to
'reboot and streamline' the
Construction Leadership
Council.

BRE, 21 Nov

The QUANTUM project aims
to close the performance gap.

RIBA, 21 Nov

BIM is a big opportunity for
small practices, according to
David Miller Architects.

The Telegraph, 21 Nov

Supermarket groups are
looking to sell roof space for
housing.

BBC, 18 Nov

Buckingham Palace is to get a
£369m refurbishment to
prevent 'catastrophic failure'.

ArchDaily, 18 Nov

Obama awards Frank Gehry
and Maya Lin the Presidential
Medal of Freedom.

GCR, 18 Nov

US bridge that can bend its
way through an earthquake.

TimeOut, 17 Nov

An old tube carriage has been
converted into a primary
school library in Lewisham.

The Guardian, 17 Nov

The number of affordable
homes built in England has
fallen to 24-year low.
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